
December 6, 2020 
 
From Fr. Jim . . . 
 
Retirement Fund for Religious:  Next Sunday December 13th, 
there is a collection for The Retirement Fund for the Religious.   
Many of us would not be where we are today in the practice of our 
faith if it were not for the faith of our parents and the faith of the 
religious sisters and brothers who have dedicated their lives to 
teaching the faith and living the faith in service of so many of God’s 
people.  This fund is always a way to show our deep gratitude to 
them and to show our care and love for them in the needs of their 
retirement.  In a television advertisement for this fund, an elderly 
sister with a walker is making her way to her chair in the chapel.  
She is saying that there are many things that she can no longer do 
because of her age but one thing she will always be able to do is 
pray.  She assures everyone that she is praying for us every day.  
She calls this her prayer ministry.  The advertisement ends by 
asking the viewer to consider supporting the fund in some way and 
to remember the retired religious because “you know that they are 
remembering you.”  Thank you so much for keeping them in your 
prayers and for your generosity.  
 
For Your Advent Prayer and Reflection: As the Season of Advent 
invites us to be awake and aware of the many ways that God has 
come, is coming and will come into our lives, where do we hunger 
the most for God’s merciful love?  Where does our world need it 
the most?   Come, Lord Jesus, quickly come with your saving grace. 
The Blessed Virgen Mary, from the moment of her conception, was 
free to say “Yes” to the presence of the Lord in her life without the 
effects, limits and conditions of sin.  While we do not live our lives 
sinless as did Mary, nonetheless, we can, like Mary, choose to do 
God’s will.  God comes to us, too.  What is God’s will for us?  To 
what is God asking us to say, “Yes?” 
 
John the Baptist calls for repentance as we prepare for the Lord to 
come into our lives.  We need to acknowledge our shortcomings 
and change our ways.  We need help in order to say “yes’’ to God’s 
will fully and completely as Mary models for us.  We need God’s 
forgiveness and mercy to keep saying “yes” to God’s will and way 
of Love.  Where do we need God’s mercy the most? For what do 
we need forgiveness?  Come, Lord, Jesus, quickly come with your 
saving grace. 
 
What can I do In Advent to prepare the way of the Lord?  Simple 
acts of kindness like holding the door for someone; saying please 
and thank you; Be kind, courteous and smile; Do works of mercy – 
feed someone or donate to our food pantry; share clothes with 
someone or donate to St. Vincent DePaul or Helping Hands in 
North Fairmount.  Perhaps our parish Wish List in the bulletin can 
offer suggestions to you.  Listen to someone; free yourself from 
distractions like the cell phone and be really present to someone.  
Celebrate the Sacrament of Reconciliation; come to our weekly 
Thursday night Mass; Pray a Hail Mary to our Lady of Guadalupe.  
Learn about St. Nicholas, or St. John the Baptist; Introduce yourself 

in church to someone 
you do not know and 
find out a little bit 
more about them.  
Make a family Advent 
Wreath and light the 
first two candles.  
Come, Lord Jesus.  
Quickly Come! 
 
I recently read this 
post on Facebook:  
“While you are waiting for the Lord, do what waiters do – Serve!”   
 
Sunday Mass: 10:30am, limited seating available, or join Fr. Jim as 
he livestreams Sunday Mass at 10:30am at:  RCC St. Leo Church 
Cincinnati: 
https://www.facebook.com/search/top/?q=rcc%20st%20leo%20ch
urch%20cincinnati&epa=SEARCH_BOX 
 
You can read the Sunday bulletin at: 
www.saintleo.org/Pulications/StLeoSundayBulletin 
You can read Fr. Jim’s letter at: www.saint-
leo.org/Publications/FromtheDeskofFrJim 
 
St. Leo’s Annual Toy and Clothing Sale 
Mark, your calendars for December 6th! Help make Christmas 
Memories for those in need. Our annual Toy and Clothing Sale is 
Sunday December 6th from 2:00 p.m. -5:00pm in Centennial Hall. 
We could also use help on the day of the sale, Sunday December 
6th, help to set-up, move product and clean-up will help make the 
sale more successful and easier for all involved. If you would like to 
volunteer on either day please email Judie Kuhlman at 
judiekuhlman@gmail.com  
 
St. Leo's is looking for two area rugs, one 9x12, and 8x10 for two 
employee offices. We are also in need of Amazon Gift Cards for our 
wish list items and office needs. Please call the office at 513-921-
1044 if you have questions or would like to donate these items. 
 
Help our Elders.  In good times and bad, senior Catholic sisters, 
brothers, and religious order priests have dedicated themselves to 
service and acts of mercy. Today, they pray for an aching world. 
Yet years of serving for little or no pay have left religious 
communities without enough retirement savings. Your gift on 
December 13th to the Retirement Fund for Religious helps provide 
medications, nursing care and other necessities. Look for our 
second collection next Sunday.  
 
Congratulations!!! to our parishioners from St. Xavier High School 
who made first and second honors for the first quarter. Erik 
Bernardo Deleon, Hatungimana Jacques, and Henry Velasquez-
Solis. 

 

 


